F281-629 (Rev.	592)	16-0226	1		
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM			c Parts 8	ice
	P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449		219	Fleetpride Truck & Trailer Parts 5122 Dietrich Rd., Ste. 108 San Antonio, TX 78219	Wert Welder & Tank Service
	TABULATION OF BIDS		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Road San Antonio, TX 78219	k & J id., Si X 782	Tank
PROPOSAL FOR:	Annual Contract for Truck Body Trailer Parts and Service		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Roa San Antonio, TX	Truch ich R io, T	ler &
TIME &	(September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017)		west femb	pride Dietr	Weld
DATE: ITEM NO.	3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016 description and approximate quantity		South 343 C San ⊉	Fleetj 5122 San ≱	Wert
ITEM 1	DEXTER PRODUCTS SUCH AS AXELS, SUSPENSIONS				
	AND BRAKE PARTS Estimated SAWS will purchase \$20,000.00 of Dexter producst per year		20,000.00		
1.	Percent of discount offered		0%		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		Dexter Axle		
2	Tura mina askadula (daalaa jakkaa ata )		Net Deine		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		
4.	Price schedule number		Dexter Axle Parts 3-1-15		
			1460110		
5.	Date of price schedule		March 1, 2015		
	Price schedule column on which discount is				
6.	based (I.e., distributor, net, wholesale)		SAWS Net		
ITEM 2	BULLDOG PRODUCTS SUCH AS JACKS AND LANDING GEAR				
	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$3,000.00 of Bulldog producst per year		3,000.00		
1.	Percent of discount offered		0%		
2.	Product indentification (Mfg.)		Cequent (Bulldog)		
<u> </u>	roduct indentification (wig.)		Cequein (Buildog)		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		
				DIED	
4.	Price schedule number		2016 Cequent	ULA TE B	0
				ID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
5.	Date of price schedule		5/27/2016	T T O	NO
	Price schedule column on which discount is			NCC	
6. ITEM 3	based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) HOLLAND PRODUCTS SUCH AS HOOKS, DRAWBARS	-	SAWS Net	BII	
112010	AND LANDING GEAR				
1.	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$6,000.00 of Holland producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>6,000.00</b> 0%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		SAF Holland		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		
			SAF Holland		
4.	Price schedule number		July, 2016		
F	Date of mice schedule				
5.	Date of price schedule		July 1, 2016	1	
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale)		SAWS Net		
ITEM 4	REESE PRODUCTS SUCH AS HITCHES AND TOWING		SAWS NOL	1	
	PRODUCTS Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,200.00 of Reese producst per year		1,200.00		
1.	Percent of discount offered		0%	ļ	
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Cequent (Reese)		
2	Tuna nrias sahadula (daalar, iabbar, ata )		NT-4 Date		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		

E281 (20 /B	500	16-0226			
F281-629 (Rev.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449		8219	Trailer Parts Ste. 108 8219	nk Service
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	TABULATION OF BIDS         Annual Contract for Truck Body         Trailer Parts and Service         (September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017)         3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016         DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Road San Antonio, TX 78219	Fleetpride Truck & Trailer Parts 5122 Dietrich Rd., Ste. 108 San Antonio, TX 78219	Wert Welder & Tank Service
4.	Price schedule number		2016 Cequent		
5.	Date of price schedule		5/27/2016		
6. ITEM 5	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) PUTNAM PRODUCTS SUCH AS TRAILER BALLS AND BALL MOUNTS		SAWS Net		
1.	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Putman producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 0%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Cequent (Reese/Drawtite)		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		NO BID
4.	Price schedule number		2016 Cequent		
5.	Date of price schedule		5/27/2016	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale)		SAWS Net		
<b>ITEM 6</b> 1.	DICO PRODUCTS SUCH AS COUPLERS Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Dico producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 0%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Titan By Dexter Axle		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		List Price		
4.	Price schedule number		Titan 8-23-16		
5.	Date of price schedule		August 23, 2016		
6. ITEM 7	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) BUYERS PRODUCTS SUCH AS D-RINGS, LATCHES, HINGERS		SAWS Price	-	
1. 1.	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Buyer producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 37%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Buyers Product		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		List/Net		
4.	Price schedule number		None		
5.	Date of price schedule		8/1/2016		
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale)		List		

F281-629 (Rev.	5/92)	16-0226	l	s,	
	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		іd 78219	& Trailer Part ., Ste. 108 78219	ank Service
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	Annual Contract for Truck Body Trailer Parts and Service (September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017) 3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Road San Antonio, TX 78219	Fleetpride Truck & Trailer Parts 5122 Dietrich Rd., Ste. 108 San Antonio, TX 78219	Wert Welder & Tank Service
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY COLE HERSEE PRODUCTS SUCH AS CONNECTORS AND SWITCHES Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Cole Hersee producst per year Percent of discount offered		1,000.00	E IS	M
1.			0% Pollak	-	
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)			-	
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber	-	
4.	Price schedule number		W07-16	-	
5.	Date of price schedule		July 1, 2016	-	
6. ITEM 9	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) POLLACK PRODUCTS SUCH AS PLUGS AND CONNECTORS		SAWS Net	-	
1.	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Pollack producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 0%	-	NO BID
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Pollak	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Jobber		
4.	Price schedule number		W07-16		
5.	Date of price schedule		July 1, 2016	D NOT TABULATI INCOMPLETE BID	
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e., distributor, net, wholesale)		SAWS Net	BID NC	
<b>ITEM 10</b> 1.	PHILLIPS PRODUCTS SUCH AS AIR AND ELECTRICAL PRODUCTS Estimated SAWS will purchase \$2,000.00 of Phillips producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>2,000.00</b> +7% or (WD/.93)		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Phillips	-	
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Warehouse Distributor	-	
4.	Price schedule number		2016 Phillips Ind. WD Price List		
5.	Date of price schedule		January 1, 2016	-	
6. ITEM 11	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) HAYES LEMMERZ PRODUCTS SUCH AS BRAKE CONTROLS		1-1-16 WD		
11EM 11	HAYES LEMMERZ PRODUCTS SUCH AS BRAKE CONTROLS Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Hayes Lemmerz producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 0%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Hayes Brake Controller		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Dealer		

F281-629 (Rev. 5	5/02)	16-0226			1
1201-029 (Rev. 5	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449		219	Trailer Parts Ste. 108 \$219	ık Service
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE:	TABULATION OF BIDS         Annual Contract for Truck Body         Trailer Parts and Service         (September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017)         3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Road San Antonio, TX 78219	Fleetpride Truck & Trailer Parts 5122 Dietrich Rd., Ste. 108 San Antonio, TX 78219	Wert Welder & Tank Service
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		N 3 N	щνх	<u>^</u>
4.	Price schedule number		None		
5.	Date of price schedule		January 1, 2016		
6. ITEM 12	Price schedule column on which discount is based (I.e.,distributor, net, wholesale) TEKOSHA PRODUCTS SUCH AS BRAKE CONTROLS & BRAKEAWAY STICHES		Dealer		
1. 1.	Estimated SAWS will purchase \$1,000.00 of Tekonsha producst per year Percent of discount offered		<b>1,000.00</b> 0%		
2.	Product identification (Mfg.)		Cequent (Tekonsha)		
3.	Type price schedule (dealer, jobber, etc.)		Net Price		
4.	Price schedule number		2016 Cequent		
5.	Date of price schedule		5/27/2016		
6.	Price schedule column on which discount is based (Le.,distributor, net, wholesale)		SAWS Net		
ITEM 13	INDIVIDUAL ITEMS 50 ea. Connector Trailer Female, Phillips, #15-720, SAWS #33446	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.67 333.50	JLATED E BID	_
	70 ea. Connector Trailer Male, Phillips, #15-730, SAWS #33447	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.66 396.20	BID NOT TABULATED INCOMPLETE BID	NO BID
	40 ea. Connector Trailer Male, Pollak, #12-706, SAWS #33034	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.80 112.00	BID NO INCO	
	30 ea. Connector Trailer Female, Pollak, #12-707, SAWS #33035	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.39 101.70		
	40 ea. Connector Trailer Female, Cole Hersee, #1235, SAWS #10687	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.96 158.40		
	60 ea. Connector Trailer Male, Cole Hersee, #1236, SAWS #10710	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.72 163.20		
	30 ea. Connector Trailer Female, Grote, #82-1020	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.34 100.20		
	40 ea. Connector Trailer Male, Grote, #82-1021	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	2.34 93.60		
	20 ea. Solenoid, Cole Hersee, #24059, SAWS #16437	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	17.99 359.80		
	30 ea. Solenoid, Venturo, #15831C	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53.98 1,619.40		
	30 ea. Solenoid, Venturo, #15832D	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	126.80 3,804.00		
	40 ea. Pintle Hooks Bolts, Buyers, #B9020, SAWS #7847	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.59 143.60		

F281-629 (Rev.	5/02)	16-0226		1 .	
F201-029 (Rev.	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		1 78219	¢ Trailer Parts , Ste. 108 78219	unk Service
PROPOSAL FOR: TIME & DATE: ITEM NO.	Annual Contract for Truck Body Trailer Parts and Service (September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017) 3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Southwest Wheel 343 Gembler Road San Antonio, TX 78219	Fleetpride Truck & Trailer Parts 5122 Dietrich Rd., Ste. 108 San Antonio, TX 78219	Wert Welder & Tank Service
	40 ea. Pintle Eye, Buyers, #B16137, SAWS #7707	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	23.85 954.00		
	20 ea. Pintle Hook, Reese, #63015, SAWS #8624	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	49.21 984.20		
	30 ea. Pintle Hook, Holland, #PH760	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	272.67 8,180.10		
	35 ea. Switech Monetary, Cole Hersee, #55021, SAWS #16461	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3.98 139.30	_	
	30 ea. Switch Monetary, Cole Hersee, #55054, SAWS #16380	UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT	6.40 192.00	-	
	25 ea. Pintle Alarm Switch, Cole Hersee, #90043, SAWS #16415	PRICE TOTAL UNIT	8.65 216.25	-	
	15 ea. Master Disconnect Switch, Cole Hersee, #2484	PRICE TOTAL	15.91 238.65	-	
ITEM 14	TOTAL ITEM 13 LABOR AND SERVICE	TOTAL	18,290.10	D ED	
<u>A.</u>	Estimated SAWS will use 25 labor hours for in Shop Service per year Labor Rate for in Shop Service		25 hours 75.00/hour		
В.	Up-Charge for outside labor, cost plus		20%	ABULA' LETE BI	NO BID
	TOTAL ITEM 14 Business Hours	TOTAL	5,250.00 8:00 a.m 5:00 p.m. 5 days	L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L L	ON
			Weekend Closed	_ ¤	
ITEM 15	SHOP SUPPLIES Percent of labor charges charged as shop supplies		5%		
ITEM 16	BULK MATERIALS Cost plus percentage for bulk materilas used to repair vehicles		20%		
		TOTAL		_	
		TOTAL	*	_	
	GRAND TOTAL (September 1, 2016 - December 31, 2017)	TOTAL	83,653.34	-	
	EXTENSION 1		62,740.10	-	
	EXTENSION 2		62,740.10	-	
	EXTENSION 3		62,740.10		

F281 (20 (B	5 (10)	16-0226			
F281-629 (Rev	SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM P. O. BOX 2449 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 TABULATION OF BIDS		ا مو ۲۶219	c & Trailer Parts d., Ste. 108 ζ 78219	Tank Service
PROPOSAL	Annual Contract for Truck Body		ihwest Wheel Gembler Road Antonio, TX 7	Truck ich Rd io, TX	Wert Welder &
FOR:	Trailer Parts and Service		st V bble mic		Ide
TIME &	(September 1, 2016 through December 31, 2017)		hwest W Gembler Antonio,	tpride True Dietrich Antonio, 7	We
DATE:	3:00 p.m., August 29, 2016		Southwest 343 Gembl San Antoni	Fleetpride 5122 Dietr San Anton	ert 1
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Sout 343 San	Fle 511 Sai	We
	Terms		Net 30 days		
	Delivery Days		3 days		

\*Low Bidder

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo City Truck Service Fleet Pride H&E Equipment H&V Equipment Ranch Hand Truck Accessoris SA Brake and Clutch Southwest Wheel Utility Trailer Wabash Werts Welding Demandstar SAWS Website